TITLE: " CROSSTALK"MAGAZINE / Program 3807-S
Term: JUNE 1, 2001 TO MAY 31, 2002 (W/OPTIONS)

Basis ELEPHANT PRESS LETTER-KRAFT PRTG LITHEXCEL dbaWBC INC. MONARCH LITHO
Item No. DESCRIPTION of State 430 Code 30272 State 040 Code 51660 State 040 Code 60078 State 040 Code 60078
Award UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST
l. PRINTING AND DISTRIBUTION:
@ Cover pages (1) and (4)
Four Color Process
3.|Makeready and setup 12[ x 320.00] 3,840.00] 100.00 1,200.00f 400.00| 4,800.00] 465.00| 5,580.00]
4.|Per 1,000 copies 300 x 30.00 9,000.00] 10.00] 3,000.00] 20.00 6,000.00] 35.50 10,650.00f
(b) Cover pages(2) and (3)
Black Ink
1.|Makeready and setup 12[ x 40.00 480.00f 25.00 300.00f 68.00 816.00f 105.00 1,260.00f
2.|Per 1,000 copies 300 x 5.00 1,500.00f 6.00 1,800.00f 15.00] 4,500.00] 8.00 2,400.00]
(c) Text per page (includes insert)
Black Ink
1.|Makeready and Setup 39| x 15.00) 5,850.00] 5.00 1,950.00f 10.00] 3,900.00] 19.00) 7,410.00]
2.|Per 1,000 copies 9750 x 3.50) 34,125.00) 350 34,125.00] 350 34,125.00] 3.00 29,250.00]
Four Color Process
3.|Makeready and setup 6| x 160.00 960.00f 100.00 600.00f 160.00 960.00f 215.00 1,290.00f
4.|Per 1,000 copies 150| x 30.00 4,500.00] 5.00 750.00f 20.00 3,000.00] 9.50 1,425.00f
1. FILMS: Trim/Page-Size Film
(a) | Trim/Page-size unit from cameracopy....... Per film 32[ x 7.00 224.00 10.00 320.00] 3.00 96.00] 10.00 320.00]
(b) Trim/Page-size unit from electronic files....Per film 39%| x 12.75 5,049.00 7.00) 2,772.00 6.00) 2,376.00] 6.00) 2,376.00
(c) ..Perillustration 20| x 10.75] 215.00f 7.00 140.00 5.00 100.00 5.00 100.00
(d) _[Square-finish halftone. Per illustration 10[ x 35.50 355.00f 7.00 70.00 5.00 50.00 8.00 80.00
(e Color corrected 4-color process illustrations
1.|First 161 sg.cm (25 sq. inch) image............. 24( x 45.00 1,080.00f 20.00) 480.00} 35.00 840.00] 50.00 1,200.00f
2.|Each additional 161 sg cm (25 sqinch). 4] x 48.00) 192.00] 10.00 40.00] 25.00 100.00] 35.00 140.00]
(f) Strip-ins (including film)..................... 2| x 5.00 10.00 10.00 20.00] 10.00 20.00] 5.00 10.00,
(g) _ [Dylux ordigital equilvent......... Each page-size unit 402 x 150 603.00] 2.00 804.00 150, 603.00] 2.00 804.00
(h) _ [One-piece laminated proofs (cromalin or similar)....
.......................... per color per trim/page-size unit 18] x 32.00 576.00] 15.00 270.00] 5.00 90.00] 10.00 180.00]
() Timework.....oooovvveiieiiiiiicci e Per hour 2| x 35.00 70.00] 75.00 150.00] 60.00) 120.00] 65.00) 130.00]
1. PAPER: Per 1000 |eaves
(8 [White opacified offset book, 90 g/m? (60 Ib)... 4800 x 8.50) 40,800.00] 10.00 48,000.00] 10.00] 48,000.00] 750 36,000.00]
(b)  |Whitelitho coated cover, 215 g/m? (80 Ib) 640| x 29.00 18,560.00] 20.00 12,800.00f 45.00 28,800.00] 26.00 16,640.00]
(c) _ |Whiteindex, 200 g/m? (110 |b) 100] x 25.00 2,500.00] 14.00 1,400.00f 30.00 3,000.00] 18.50) 1,850.00f
V. ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS:
@ Creating & affixing labels from furnished electronic
media. ..o Per 1000 |abels 240[ x 45.00) 10,800.00] 54.00 12,960.00) 17.00) 4,080.00) 45.00 10,800.00]
CONTRACTOR TOTALS $141,289.00 $123,951.00 $146,376.00 $129,895.00
DISCOUNT if any NET 2.000% 2,479.02 2.000% 2,927.52 2.000% 2,597.90
DISCOUNTED TOTALS $141,289.00 $121,471.98 $143,448.48 $127,297.10
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TITLE: " CROSSTALK"MAGAZINE / Program 3807-S
Term: JUNE 1, 2001 TO MAY 31, 2002 (W/OPTIONS)

Basis MONROE GRAPHICS PRECISION LITHO SPRUCE PRINTING CO STARLINE PRINTING
Item No. DESCRIPTION of State 310 Code 60195 Salt L ake City Utah State420 Code 82418 State 300 Code 83186
Award UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST
I PRINTING AND DISTRIBUTION:
[€)] Cover pages (1) and (4)
Four Color Process
3.|Makeready and setup 12| x 495.00 5,940.00|No Bid 275.00 3300.00f 122.00} 1,464.0
4.|Per 1,000 copies 300 x 41.00 12,300.00|No Bid 6.50 1950.00 29.60) 8,880.0f
(b) Cover pages(2) and (3)
Black Ink
1.|Makeready and setup 12| x 357.00 4,284.00|No Bid 100.00) 1200.00] 26.60) 319.2]
2.|Per 1,000 copies 300 x 20.25 6,075.00|No Bid 3.20 960.00f 8.80 2,640.0f
(c) Text per page (includes insert)
Black Ink
1.|Makeready and Setup 390 x 7.00 2,730.00|No Bid 28.75| 11212.50] 13.30 5,187.0
2.|Per 1,000 copies 9750[ x 2.55) 24,862.50|No Bid 3.00 29250.00] 2.50) 24,375.0|
Four Color Process
3.|Makeready and setup 6| x 52.50 315.00|No Bid 50.00 300.00f 120.00 720.0
4.|Per 1,000 copies 150[ x 6.05 907.50|No Bid 6.00 900.00f 20.00] 3,000.0f
1. FILMS: Trim/Page-Size Film
(a) | Trim/Page-size unit from cameracopy....... Per film 32[ x 3.00 96.00]No Bid 5.00 160.00] 3.25 104.0
(b) Trim/Page-size unit from electronic files....Per film 39| x 9.25 3,663.00|No Bid 7.00 2772.00] 6.75) 2,673.0]
(€  JLine..iiiiiiiiiiiiiiii e Per illustration 20[ x 5.00 100.00] 5.00 100.00] 5.00 100.00] 4.00 80.0
(d) Square-finish halftone................... Per illustration 10| x 12.50 125.00] 25.00 250.00 8.00 80.00] 7.20 72.0
(e Color corrected 4-color process illustrations
1.|First 161 sg.cm (25 sq. inch) image............. Per set 24( x 55.00) 1,320.00| 50.00) 1,200.00| 35.00 840.00] 60.00) 1,440.0
2.|Each additional 161 sgcm (25sqinch)........ Per set 4] x 22.00 88.00] 50.00) 200.00] 30.00, 120.00] 60.00) 240.0]
(f) Strip-ins (including film)... 2l x 7.00 14.00 50.00) 100.00] 5.00 10.00 5.00 10.0]
(g) _ [Dylux ordigital equilvent.........Each page-size unit 402 x 3.10 1,246.20| 68.00) 27,336.00) 1.00 402.00f 1.00 402.0]
(h) _ [One-piece laminated proofs (cromalin or similar)....
.......................... per color per trim/page-size unit 18] x 37.00 666.00] 75.00 1,350.00f 15.00 270.00] 6.00 108.0
() Timework.....oooovvviieiiiiiicii e Per hour 2l x 75.00 150.00] 100.00) 200.00] 37.00 74.00] 40.00 80.0
1. PAPER: Per 1000 |leaves
(8 |White opacified offset book, 90 g/m? (601b).......... 4800] x 8.90) 42,720.00|No Bid 9.23 44304.00) 8.75) 42,0000
(b)  |Whitelitho coated cover, 215 g/m? (80 Ib) 640| x 3048 19,507.20|No Bid 29.58) 18931.20] 22.00] 14,080.0f
(c) \White index, 200 g/n? (110 |b) 100[ x 19.75 1,975.00|No Bid 21.60) 2160.00f 32.50 3,250.0f
V. ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS:
@ Creating & affixing labels from furnished electronic
MEHIAL i Per 1000 |abels 240[ x 45.00) 10,800.00] 35.00 8,400.00] 50.00 12000.00 57.00 13,680.0f
CONTRACTOR TOTALS $139,884.40 $39,136.00 $131,295.70 $124,804.20
DISCOUNT if any 0.250% 349.71 NET 1.000% 1,312.96 NET
DISCOUNTED TOTALS $139,534.69 $39,136.00 $129,982.74 $124,804.20
AWARDED
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TITLE: " CROSSTALK"MAGAZINE / Program 3807-S
Term: JUNE 1, 2001 TO MAY 31, 2002 (W/OPTIONS)

Basis TAMMSLITHO WESTERN PRESS REFLECTION PRINTING
Item No. DESCRIPTION of State 480 Code 85946 State 240 Code 94090 State 150 Code 74180
Award UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST
I PRINTING AND DISTRIBUTION:
@ Cover pages (1) and (4)
Four Color Process
3.|Makeready and setup 12| x |No Charge 350.00 4,200.0f 124.00 1,488.0
4.|Per 1,000 copies 300] x |No Charge 22.00 6,600.0f 32.00 9,600.0f
(b) Cover pages(2) and (3)
Black Ink
1.|Makeready and setup 12| x |No Charge 100.00, 1,200.0 20.00) 240.0]
2.|Per 1,000 copies 300 x |No Charge 5.25 1575.0 6.00 1,800.0
(c) Text per page (includes insert)
Black Ink
1.|Makeready and Setup 390 x 33.91] 13,224.9| 800.00 312,000.0 4.50 1,755.0
2.|Per 1,000 copies 9750 x 8.44 82,290.0f 46.00 448,500.0] 275 26,812.5]
Four Color Process
3.|Makeready and setup 6| x 35.82 214.9 450.00] 2,700.0f 140.00 840.0]
4.|Per 1,000 copies 150[ x 8.50 1,275.0 27.25) 4,087.5| 30.00 4,500.0f
1. FILMS: Trim/Page-Size Film
(a) | Trim/Page-size unit from cameracopy....... Per film 32| x |No Charge 11.75 376.0] 3.00 96.0
(b) Trim/Page-size unit from electronic files....Per film 39| x |No Charge 9.75] 3,861.0} 8.00) 3,168.0}
() ...Perillustration 20| x 4.00 80.0 6.00 120.0] 350 70.0
(d)  [Square-finish halftone. .Per illustration 10| x 10.00 100.0 8.00 80.0 6.50 65.0
(e Color corrected 4-color process illustrations
1.|First 161 sg.cm (25 sq. inch) image. 24] x 51.00) 1,224.0 15.00 360.0] 34.00 816.0]
2.|Each additional 161 sg cm (25 sq inch) 4] x 45.00 180.0 20.00 80.0 40.00) 160.0
(f) Strip-ins (including film)... 2l x 5.00 10.0] 6.00 12.0] 4.00 8.0]
(g) _ [Dylux ordigital equilvent... Each page-size unit 402 x 245 984.9] 1.00 402.0] 2.00 804.0]
(h) _ [One-piece laminated proofs (cromalin or similar)....
per color per trim/page-size unit 18| x 15.19 2734 7.50) 135.0 25.00] 450.0f
[0) 2| x 60.00 120.0] 60.00 120.0] 50.00 100.0]
1. PAPER: Per 1000 |eaves
(8 [White opacified offset book, 90 g/m? (60 Ib).. 4800 x 14.30 68,640.0f 7.80) 37,440.0] 10.20) 48,960.0]
(b)  |Whitelitho coated cover, 215 g/m? (80 Ib).. 640| x 55.40 35,456.0) 30.35 19,424.0| 29.00 18,560.0f
(c) _|Whiteindex, 200 g/m? (110 Ib) 100[ x 39.80) 3,980.0) 28.00) 2,800.0) 25.00) 2,500.0)
V. ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS:
@ Creating & affixing labels from furnished electronic
medial....oooviiiiiiiiiii Per 1000 labels 240 x 50.00) 12,000.0] 28.00) 6,720.0] 58.00) 13,920.0]
CONTRACTOR TOTALS $220,053.14 $852,792.50 $136,712.50
DISCOUNT if any 5.000% 11,002.66 0.500% 4,263.96 1.000% 1,367.13
DISCOUNTED TOTALS $209,050.48 $848,528.54 $135,345.37
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