
 TITLE:  "Short-run Copying/Duplicating(Including Color copying)" / Program 2849-SP
TERM:  February 1, 2002 TO 
January 31, 2003 (W/Options)

 

Basis BASIN PRTG & IMAGING IMPACT PRTG & GRAPHICS GPO ESTIMATE 
Item No. DESCRIPTION of State 050 Code 10230 State 050 Code 44171 Progam 2841SP, 2897S, 3802S

Award UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST
I. COMPLETE PRODUCT (Except Items II. & III.):  

Running Per 100 Copies  
Black Image Only:  

(a) 216 x 279 mm  (8½ x 11")  Cover and/or Text…….per page 730 x 7.00 5,110.00 8.24 6,015.20 8.00 5,840.00
(b) 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11") foldins……per printed side 260 x 18.00 4,680.00 9.46 2,459.60 14.00 3,640.00

Color Copying:  
(c) Color copying 216 x 279 mm (8½ x 11")….per leaf copied one side only 137 x 90.00 12,330.00 125.00 17,125.00 110.00 15,070.00
(d) Color copying 216 x 279 mm (8½ x 11")….per leaf copied face and back 75 x 180.00 13,500.00 No Bid 220.00 16,500.00
(e) Color copying a 432 x 279 mm  (17 x 11") …….per leaf copied one side only 17 x 150.00 2,550.00 196.20 3,335.40 220.00 3,740.00
(f) Color copying a 432 x 279 mm  (17 x 11") …….per leaf copied face and back 8 x 300.00 2,400.00 No Bid 440.00 3,520.00
(g) Die Cut Tab Dividers (includes die-cutting, paper, collating, and  

inserting); Leaves duplicated/copied face only 9 x 80.00 720.00 10.00 90.00 26.00 234.00
II. PAPER:  Per 100 leaves  

(a) White Offset Book, 75 g/m² (50 lb), White Bond, 75 g/m² (20 lb.), White  
Writing, 75 g/m² (20 lb) or White Plain Copier, Xerographic, 75 g/m² (20 lb) 475 x 0.70 332.50 No Bid No Charge

(b) White Offset Book, 90 g/m² (60 lb) 135 x 2.00 270.00 No Bid 1.10 148.50
(c) Colored Writing, 75 g/m² (20 lb) 150 x 2.00 300.00 No Bid 3.20 480.00
(d) White or colored Vellum-Finish Cover, 175 gm² (65 lb) 30 x 6.50 195.00 No Bid 2.30 69.00
(e) White or colored Index, 200 g/m² (110 lb) 26 x 7.00 182.00 No Bid 2.53 65.78

III. ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS:  
(a) Kraft or Rubber Band…each package 50 x 0.01 0.50 No Bid 0.11 5.50
(b) Stitching with one or two stitches……………….per book 175 x 0.10 17.50 No Bid 0.09 15.75
(c) Folding…per 100 leaves 40 x 10.00 400.00 No Bid 12.80 512.00
(d) Comb Binding…per book 150 x 1.65 247.50 1.00 150.00 2.25 337.50
(e) Drilling…per 100 leaves 75 x 10.00 750.00 1.00 75.00 3.60 270.00
(f) Wrapping or Shrink-Film packaging…per 100 packages 50 x 50.00 2,500.00 No Charge 70.00 3,500.00
(g) Thermal Tape Binding…per book 105 x 1.45 152.25 No Bid 0.79 82.95
(h) Color Transparency, including material…per each 32 x 2.00 64.00 No Bid 1.68 53.76
(I) Black & White Transparency, including material…per each 20 x 1.00 20.00 No Bid 1.07 21.40

CONTRACTOR TOTALS $46,721.25 $29,250.20 $54,106.14
DISCOUNT if any 2%-10 DAYS NET

DISCOUNTED TOTALS $46,721.25 $29,250.20 $54,106.14
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